
5.2  Insurance Requirements.  

Contractor shall carry insurance in the types and amounts indicated in this Article for the duration of the 
Contract. The required insurance shall include coverage for Owner’s property prior to construction, 
during construction and during the warranty period. The insurance shall be evidenced by delivery to 
Owner of certificates of insurance executed by the insurer or its authorized agent stating coverages, 
limits, expiration dates and compliance with all applicable required provisions. Upon request, Owner, 
and/or its agents, shall be entitled to receive without expense, copies of the policies and all 
endorsements. Contractor shall update all expired policies prior to submission for monthly payment. 
Failure to update policies shall be reason for withholding of payment until renewal is provided to 
Owner. 5.2.1 Contractor, consistent with its status as an independent contractor, shall provide and 
maintain all insurance coverage with the minimum amounts described below until the end of the 
warranty period unless otherwise stated in Owner’s Supplementary General Conditions or Special 
Conditions. Failure to maintain insurance coverage, as required, is grounds for suspension of Work for 
cause pursuant to Article 14. The Contractor will be notified of the date on which the Builder’s Risk 
insurance policy may be terminated by any means deemed appropriate by Owner. 5.2.2 Coverage shall 
be written on an occurrence basis by companies authorized and admitted to do business in the State of 
Texas and rated A-, VII or better by A.M. Best Company or similar rating company or otherwise 
acceptable to Owner. 5.2.2.1 Insurance Coverage Required. 5.2.2.1.1 Workers’ Compensation. Insurance 
with limits as required by the Texas Workers’ Compensation Act, with the policy endorsed to provide a 
waiver of subrogation as to Owner, employer’s liability and Employer’s Liability Insurance with limits of 
not less than: $100,000 $1,000,000 each accident; $100,000 $1,000,000 disease each employee ; and 
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$1,000,000 disease policy limit. Policies must include (a) Other States Endorsement to include TEXAS if 
business is domiciled outside the State of Texas, and (b) a waiver of all rights of subrogation in favor of 
Owner. 5.2.2.1.2 Commercial General Liability Insurance, including premises, operations, independent 
contractor’s liability, products and completed operations and contractual liability, covering, but not 
limited to, the liability assumed under the indemnification provisions of this Contract, fully insuring 
Contractor’s (or Subcontractor’s) liability for bodily injury (including death) and property damage with a 
minimum limit of: $1,000,000 per occurrence; $2,000,000 general aggregate; $2,000,000 products and 
completed operations aggregate; and Coverage shall be on an “occurrence” basis. The policy shall 
include coverage extended to apply to completed operations and explosion, collapse, and underground 
hazards. The policy shall include endorsement CG2503 Amendment of Aggregate Limits of Insurance 
(per Project) or its equivalent. If the Work involves any activities within fifty (50) feet of any railroad, 
railroad protective insurance as may be required by the affected railroad, written for not less than the 
limits required by such railroad. 5.2.2.1.3 Asbestos Abatement Liability Insurance, including coverage for 
liability arising from the encapsulation, removal, handling, storage, transportation, and disposal of 
asbestos containing materials. *This requirement applies if the Work or the Project includes asbestos 
containing materials. The combined single limit for bodily injury and property damage will be a 
minimum of $1,000,000 per occurrence. *Specific requirement for claims-made form: Required period 
of coverage will be determined by the following formula: continuous coverage for life of the Contract, 
plus one (1) year (to provide coverage for the warranty period), and an extended discovery period for a 
minimum of five (5) years which shall begin at the end of the warranty period. Employer’s liability limits 
for asbestos abatement will be: $500,000 $1,000,000 each accident; $500,000 $1,000,000 disease each 
employee; and $500,000 $1,000,000 disease policy limit. 2010 Uniform General and Supplementary 
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All-Risk Builder’s Risk or all-risk installation floater (5.2.2.1.5.e) is not required. 5.2.2.1.4 Comprehensive 
Business Automobile Liability Insurance, covering all owned, hired, and non-owned vehicles, with a 
minimum combined single limit for bodily injury (including death) and property damage of $1,000,000 
per occurrence. No aggregate shall be permitted for this type of coverage. Such insurance is to include 
coverage for loading and unloading hazards. 5.2.2.1.5 All-Risk Builder’s Risk Insurance, if applicable (or 
all-risk installation floater for instances in which the project involves solely the installation of material 
and/or equipment). Coverage is determined by the Contract Sum, as detailed, below. Coverage shall be 
all-risk, including, but not limited to, fire, extended coverage, vandalism and malicious mischief, theft 
and, if applicable, flood, earth movement and named storm. Builder’s risk and installation floater limits 
shall be equal to 100 percent of the Contract Sum plus, if any, existing property and Owner-furnished 
equipment specified by Owner. The policy shall be written jointly in the names of Owner and Contractor. 
Subcontractors shall be named as additional insureds. The policy shall have endorsements as follows: 
5.2.2.1.5.1 This insurance shall be specific as to coverage and not contributing insurance with any 
permanent insurance maintained on the property. 5.2.2.1.5.2 This insurance shall not contain an 
occupancy clause suspending or reducing coverage should Owner partially occupy the Site and before 
the parties have determined Substantial Completion. 5.2.2.1.5.3 Loss, if any, shall be adjusted with and 
made payable to Owner as trustee for the insureds as their interests may appear. Owner shall be named 
as loss payee. 5.2.2.1.5.4 For renovation projects or projects that involve portions of Work contained 
within an existing structure, refer to Supplementary General and Special Conditions for possible 
additional builder’s risk insurance requirements. 5.2.2.1.5.5 For Owner furnished equipment or 
materials that will be in care, custody or control of Contractor, Contractor will be responsible for 
damage and loss. 5.2.2.1.5.6 For those properties located within a Tier 1 or 2 windstorm area, named 
storm coverage must be provided with limits specified by Owner. 5.2.2.1.5.7 For those properties 
located in flood prone areas, flood insurance coverage must be provided with limits specified by Owner. 
5.2.2.1.5.8 Builder’s risk insurance policy shall remain in effect until Substantial Completion. BUILDERS 
RISK REQUIREMENT FOR PROJECTS WITH A CONTRACT SUM 


